|

T

I EE| FGISLATIVE COUNCIL
7% 2 Hon Tommy Yu-Yan CHEUNG

IEARIMB TR BTHE
Hong Kong Special Administrative Region of the People's Republic of Ching ﬁ}\ﬁ CB(1)584/13-14(01) %ﬁj{ ﬁ:
LC Paper No. CB(1)584/13-14(01)

HRLE
HEIEZE

ANBL (2013 SFENTERR (185T) HROIEE) RHEEE  BHOT

L 215 18 ffk» BB T RBRE | RS A > MRS E T EEWENE
BARAMRER  WEB AN BEYREN 12 BA RN MIEERERN 6
AN BUERHEUN SN EEHE S LR e E SR A
EVIRGHA - E 2R R AR ERRRi S BRI Rk
FTES TR AR A BRAENTERR IR SK -

2. {BIESE 23 fk - RABETHRGINER " H¥EMRRK, 0 ST 2015 &£ 2 F 23 H4F
®» BIEEIRRN - T » IISETIREIE 2013 422 7 23 HA4:R#EST -
REEMFERNERY - A BERRETH EMEEERRRTH ™ H
EIRRK ) MRS HEA - AR AL -

BEBHEF -

e
1A (2013 FENMERL (f85]) REIER) Z8E

%%a%/\

ILEE#HERFA
RERL
20134 12 H 17 H
SIERIE 1 SILERFRSAME 818F Room 818, Legislative Council Complex, 1 Legislative Council Road, Central, Hor g Kong

2397 2688 {EHFax: 2390 4487 B E4 E-mail: tyyc@netvigator.com



Stamp Duty (Amendment) Bill 2013
Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by Hon Tommy Cheung Yu-yan

Clause Amendment Proposed

18 In the proposed section 29DF —

(a) in subsection (3)(a), by deleting “6 months” and substituting “12
months”;

(b) in subsection (4)(a), by deleting “6 months” and substituting “12
months”.



Stamp Duty (Amendment) Bill 2013
Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by Hon Tommy Cheung Yu-yan

Clause Amendment Proposed

23 In the proposed section 71, by adding after subsection (4) —

“(5) Save and except for sections 29DE, 29DF, 29DG and 29DH
and those provisions in so far as they are necessary to give
effect to these sections, the (Amendment) Ordinance shall
cease to have effect at midnight on 23 February 2015 and the
pre-amended Ordinance shall be reinstated at midnight on the
same date.

(6) The Secretary for Transport and Housing may, subject to the
approval of the Legislative Council, by notice in the Gazette
amend subsection (5) by substituting for the date specified in
that subsection such date as may be specified in the notice.”.



