
立法會 CB(1)584/13-14(01)號文件 

LC Paper No. CB(1)584/13-14(01) 
 



 1

Stamp Duty (Amendment) Bill 2013 
 

Committee Stage 
 

Amendments to be moved by Hon Tommy Cheung Yu-yan 
 

 
Clause Amendment Proposed 
  

    18 In the proposed section 29DF – 
 
(a) in subsection (3)(a), by deleting “6 months” and substituting “12 

months”; 
 
(b)    in subsection (4)(a), by deleting “6 months” and substituting “12 

months”. 
  



 2

 
 
 

 
Stamp Duty (Amendment) Bill 2013 

 
Committee Stage 

 
Amendments to be moved by Hon Tommy Cheung Yu-yan 

 
 

Clause Amendment Proposed 
  

    23 In the proposed section 71, by adding after subsection (4) – 
  
           “ (5)   Save and except for sections 29DE, 29DF, 29DG and 29DH 

and those provisions in so far as they are necessary to give 
effect to these sections, the (Amendment) Ordinance shall 
cease to have effect at midnight on 23 February 2015 and the 
pre-amended Ordinance shall be reinstated at midnight on the 
same date. 

 
              (6)    The Secretary for Transport and Housing may, subject to the 

approval of the Legislative Council, by notice in the Gazette 
amend subsection (5) by substituting for the date specified in 
that subsection such date as may be specified in the notice.”. 

 
  


