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Council meeting of 30 April 2014 
 

 Motion on  
“Improving the implementation of the education policy and 

allocating additional funding for education” 
 
  Hon IP Kin-yuen has given notice to move the attached motion on 
“Improving the implementation of the education policy and allocating 
additional funding for education” at the Council meeting of 30 April 2014.  
The President has directed that it be printed in the terms in which it was handed 
in on the Agenda of the Council. 
 
 
 
 
 

 (Odelia LEUNG) 
 for Clerk to the Legislative Council 

 
Encl. 



(Translation) 
 

Motion on 
“Improving the implementation of the education policy and 

allocating additional funding for education” 
to be moved by Hon IP Kin-yuen 

at the Council meeting of 30 April 2014 
 
 

Wording of the Motion 
 
 
That, as education is an important policy area, many countries and regions 
attach great importance to education and strive to allocate resources in 
education improvement, so as to upgrade their people’s overall quality and 
enhance their societies’ competitiveness in the future; yet, the SAR 
Government’s funding allocation in education has been shrinking continuously 
in recent years, and the Education Bureau has also neither listened seriously to 
the views of the sector nor taken forward many measures on which the society 
has reached consensus, showing its ineptitude and belated awareness when 
faced with new problems and challenges, and failing to respond to people’s 
needs and allay their concerns, such as its erroneous planning for kindergarten 
and primary school places, delay in implementing 15-year free education, 
disregard for the views of the sector and reluctance to adopt effective measures 
to stabilize the teaching and learning environment of secondary schools, turning 
a blind eye to young teachers’ difficulty in joining the profession, and turning a 
deaf ear to the demands for improving the teaching establishment in 
public-sector schools and increasing the number of publicly-funded university 
places; the education sector considers that since the Secretary for Education Mr 
Eddie NG took office, parents have worried about a shortage of places for their 
children’s education, teachers’ job satisfaction has declined, and students have 
been tormented by the education policy, rendering people to rock their 
confidence in the local education system and be greatly disappointed at the 
education policy led by Eddie NG, considering that he lacks work competence 
and enterprise, and that while he cannot effectively lead the officials of the 
Education Bureau to properly implement the education policy, he still 
frequently pays overseas duty visits, causing widespread grievances about the 
education policy in society in general; in this connection, this Council expresses 
dissatisfaction with the work performance of Eddie NG, requests him to reflect 
deeply on himself, and hopes that the SAR Government can improve the 
implementation of the education policy, allocate additional funding for 
education, and extensively solicit public opinions, so as to rebuild the public 
confidence in the education system. 
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