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FW: Contract renewal for ED Page 1 of 3

Carol Wong

From: Joanna To

Sent: Tuesday, March 01, 2005 9:19 AM
To: Carol Wong

Subject: FW: Contract renewal for ED

Dear Carol
For yr record pis.

rgds
Joanna

From: Brenda Chan (ITHR)

Sent: Tuesday, March 01, 2005 8:35 AM
To: Patricia Lam

Cc: Joanna To

Subject: FW: Contract renewal for ED

Dear Pat
Please see the confirmation from Grace on payment of leave passage to Clara.

Thanks
Brenda

From: Grace Lee

Sent: Monday, February 28, 2005 11:31 PM
To: Brenda Chan (ITHR)

Cc: Joanna To

Subject: RE: Contract renewal for ED

Dear Brenda,

Have reminded Clara to sign back the contract. Will do so again. As regards the leave
passage, it was agreed that the amount can be paid to her as a non accountable allowance.
Pls proceed to make the payment accordingly.

Grace

From: Brenda Chan (ITHR)
Sent: Mon 2/28/2005 21:23

To: Grace Lee
Cc: Joanna To

26/10/2005
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FW: Contract renewal for ED Page 2 of 3

Subject: FW: Contract renewal for ED

Dear Grace

In the past, we made leavel passage payment to ED in March.

A reminder to ensure that we will be able to make timely payment this year.

Thanks
Brenda

From: Brenda Chan (ITHR)

Sent: Monday, February 21, 2005 2:51 PM
To:  Grace Lee

Subject: FW: Contract renewal for ED

Dear Grace

We have not yet received the signed contract from Clara. Have you had a chance to speak to
Clara since we talked last time?

For the payment of leave passage, shall | ask Pat Lam to effect the payment based on 3 return
tickets on Biz Class, HK-UK without the need to wait for the signed contract, which has been
enforced in practice?

Brenda

From: Patrida Lam

Sent: Monday, February 21, 2005 1:46 PM
To:  Brenda Chan (ITHR)

Subject: RE: Contract renewal for ED

Dear Brenda,

Any news? As | do not have a copy of the new contract, | have no idea how the leave passage
of $146,400 is to be paid out. Need any supportings?

Regards,

Pat

From: Patricia Lam

Sent: Tuesday, November 16, 2004 3:38 PM
To:  Brenda Chan (ITHR)

Subject: RE: Contract renewal for ED

Thanks.

26/10/2005
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FW: Contract renewal for ED Page 3 of 3

From: Brenda Chan (ITHR}

Sent: Tuesday, November 16, 2004 3:37 PM
To:  Patricia Lam

Subject: RE: Contract renewal for ED

Dear Pat
I've only got the draft. Have just asked Winnie's help. Will make a copy to you when available.

Brenda

From: Patricia Lam

Sent: Tuesday, November 16, 2004 3:32 PM
To:  Brenda Chan (ITHR)

Subject: Contract renewal for ED

Dear Brends,

Please advise if you have received the signed copy of the above (from 19 March 2004). If so,
please pass me a copy. Fyi, Grace has fold me in July/Aug that the letter has been passed for
Clara's signature.

Thanks.

Pat

26/10/2005
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