L C Paper No. CB(1)1730/07-08(03)

ROAD TRAFFIC LEGISLATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 2008

COMMITTEE STAGE

Amendments to be moved by Hon Andrew CHENG Kar-foo

Clause Amendment Proposed

7(1) @ In the proposed section 39(2A)(a), by deleting "3
months" and substituting "6 months".

(b) In the proposed section 39(2B)(a), by deleting
"3months" and substituting "6 months’.

() In the proposed section 39(2C)(a), by deleting "3
months" and substituting "6 months".

8(1) @ In the proposed section 39A(2A)(a), by deleting "3
months" and substituting "6 months".

(b) In the proposed section 39A(2B)(a), by deleting
"3months" and substituting "6 months’.

(© In the proposed section 39A(2C)(a), by deleting "3
months" and substituting "6 months".

9(2) @ In the proposed section 39B(7A)(a), by deleting "3
months" and substituting "6 months".

(b) In the proposed section 39B(7B)(a), by deleting
"3months" and substituting "6 months’.

(©) In the proposed section 39B(7C)(d), by deleting "3
months" and substituting "6 months".



10(1) (@ In the proposed section 39C(16A)(a), by deleting "3
months" and substituting "6 months".

(b) In the proposed section 39C(16B)(a), by deleting
"3months" and substituting "6 months’.

(© In the proposed section 39C(16C)(a), by deleting "3
months" and substituting "6 months".



