INLAND REVENUE (AMENDMENT) BILL 2009

COMMITTEE STAGE

Amendments to be moved by the Secretary for Financial Services and the Treasury

Clause

Long title

Amendment Proposed

By deleting “in the Budget introduced by the Government for the
2009-2010 financial year” and substituting “by the Government in
2009”.

(a) In the proposed Schedule 19, in section 1(a), by deleting
“50%” and substituting “100%”.

(b) In the proposed Schedule 19, in section 1(&), by deleting
*“$6,000” and substituting “$8,000”.

(c) In the proposed Schedule 19, in section 2(1){(a), by deleting
“50%" and substituting “100%”.

(d) In the proposed Schedule 19, in section 2(1)(5), by deleting
“$6,000” and substituting “$8,0007.

ALL PASSED




