3 S
L egislative Council

L C Paper No. CB(3) 276/10-11

Ref : CB(3)/B/TH/2 (09-10)

Te @ 2869 9206

Date : 3 December 2010

From : Clerk to the Legidative Council

To : All Members of the Legidlative Council

Council meeting of 8 December 2010
Road Traffic (Amendment) Bill 2010
Committee stage amendments

Members were informed vide LC Paper No. CB(3) 268/10-11
issued on 1 December 2010 that the President had given permission for the
Secretary for Transport and Housing to move her proposed amendments to
the above Bill at the Council meeting of 8 December 2010. Members
are invited to note that the President has also given permission for
Hon Andrew CHENG Kar-foo, subject to the Bill receiving a Second
Reading, to move his proposed amendments to the Bill.

2. As directed by the President, the amendments are attached for
Members consideration.

(Desmond LAM)
for Clerk to the Legidlative Council

Encl.



ROAD TRAFFIC (AMENDMENT) BILL 2010

COMMITTEE STAGE

Amendments to be moved by the Honourable Andrew CHENG Kar-foo

Clause

6(2)

6(3)

Amendment Proposed

By adding—

“(1A) Section 36(2A)(a) is amended by repealing *“2

years” and substituting “5 years”.”.

By deleting ““3 years” and substituting “5 years™” and substituting ““a

period of not less than 3 years” and substituting “life’”.

By adding—

“(2A) Section 36(2B)(a) is amended by repealing “2

% 22
. e

years” and substituting “5 years

By deleting “amended by repealing “3 years” and substituting “5 years™”

and substituting “repealed”.



6 By adding—

“(BA) Section 36(2C)(a) is amended by repealing “2

97 33

years” and substituting “5 years”.”.

2329

6(4) By deleting ““‘3 years” and substituting “5 years”” and substituting ““for

3322

a period of less than 3 years” and substituting “less than for life””.

7 (a)  Inthe proposed section 36 A(3)(a), by deleting “2 years” and

substituting “3 years”.

(b)  In the proposed section 36 A(3)(b), by deleting 5 years” and

substituting “10 years”.

(c)  Inthe proposed section 36A(4)(a), by deleting “2 years” and

substituting “3 years”.

(d)  Inthe proposed section 36 A(4)(b), by deleting “5 years™ and
substituting “10 years”.

(e)  Inthe proposed section 36A(5)(a), by deleting “2 years” and

substituting “3 years”.

(H In the proposed section 36 A(5)(b), by deleting “5 years™ and
substituting “10 years”.



8(2)

8(3)

8(4)

9(2)

9(3)

9(4)

By adding—

“(1A) Section 37(2A)(a) is amended by repealing “6

2% 9%

months” and substituting “1 year™.”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “5 years”.

By adding—

“(2A) Section 37(2B)(a) is amended by repealing “6

months” and substituting “1 year™.”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “5 years”.

By adding—

“(3A) Section 37(2C)(a) is amended by repealing “6

months” and substituting “1 year”.”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “5 years”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “3 years”.

By deleting “S years” and substituting “10 years”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “3 years”.

(W8]



9(5)

9%6)

9(7)

10(5)

11(2)

By deleting “5 years” and substituting “10 years”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “3 years”.

By deleting “5 years” and substituting “10 years”.

)

()

(d)

(e)

¢y

In the proposed section 39A(2A)(a)(i), by deleting “6 months” and

substituting “1 year”.

In the proposed section 39A(2A)(a)(ii), by deleting “12 months”

and substituting “2 years”.

In the proposed section 39A(2A)(a)(iii), by deleting “2 years” and
substituting “5 years”.

In the proposed section 39A(2A)(b)(i), by deleting “2 years” and
substituting “3 years”.

In the proposed section 39A(2A)(b)(ii), by deleting “3 years” and

substituting “5 years”.

In the proposed section 39A(2A)(b)(iii), by deleting “5 years” and

substituting “his or her lifetime”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “3 years”.



11(3)

11(4)

11(5)

11(6)

11(7)

12(2)

12(3)

12(4)

12(5)

12(6)

12(7)

By deleting “5 years” and substituting “10 years”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “3 years”.

By deleting “5 years™ and substituting “10 years™.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “3 years”.

By deleting “5 years” and substituting “10 years”.

By deleting “2 years™ and substituting “3 years”.

By deleting “5 years™ and substituting “10 years”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “3 years”.

By deleting “5 years” and substituting “10 years”.

By deleting “2 years” and substituting “3 years”.

By deleting “5 years” and substituting “10 years”.



