
LC Paper No. CB(4)818/15-16(01) 
 
 

Eastern Harbour Crossing Legislation (Amendment) Bill 2015 
 

Committee Stage 
 

Amendments to be moved by the Honourable WONG Yuk-man 
 
 

Clause         Amendment Proposed 
 
7(2) In the proposed regulation 3 (1B), by deleting “Without 

prejudice to” and substituting “Without affecting”.  
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 1, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$13” and substituting “$8”. 
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 2, in Column 2, by 

deleting everything after “Taxis”. 
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 2, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$15” and substituting “$10”. 
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 3, in Column 2, by 

deleting everything under Column 2 and 
substituting “Private cars”. 

 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 3, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$25” and substituting “$20”. 
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 4, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$38” and substituting “$10”. 
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 5, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$38” and substituting “$15”. 
  



- 2 - 
 

 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 6, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$50” and substituting “$20”. 
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 7, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$75” and substituting “$30”. 
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 8, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$50” and substituting “$10”. 
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 9, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$75” and substituting “$15”. 
 
18(4) In the proposed Part 3, in item 10, in Column 3, by 

deleting “$25” and substituting “$10”. 
 
19 In the proposed section 24, in the Chinese text, in the 

heading, by deleting “過渡性安排” and substituting “過渡

安排”.  
 
19 In the proposed section 24, in the Chinese text, by deleting 

“過渡性安排” and substituting “過渡安排”. 
 
20 In the proposed Schedule 2, in the Chinese text, in the 

heading, by deleting “過渡性安排” and substituting “過渡

安排”.  
 
20 .In the proposed Schedule 2, in the Chinese text, in section 1, 

in the definition of EHC By-laws, by deleting “指在緊接” 
and substituting “指緊接”. 

 
20  .In the proposed Schedule 2, in the Chinese text, in section 2, 

by deleting “干犯” and substituting “犯”. 
  
  



- 3 - 
 

 
20  In the proposed Schedule 2, in the Chinese text, in section 3, 

by deleting “干犯” and substituting “犯”. 
 
20 .In the proposed Schedule 2, in the Chinese text, in section 4, 

in the heading, by deleting “過渡性安排” and substituting 
“過渡安排”.  

 
New   By adding─  

“Subdivision 7─Amendment to Road Traffic (Public 
Service Vehicles) Regulations (Cap. 374D) 

 
29. Schedule 5 amended (Taxi Fares) 

  (1) Schedule 5 item 4(iv)(b)─ 
Repeal 
“the Eastern Harbour Crossing or ”.  
 

(2) Schedule 5 after item 4(iv)(b)─ 
Add 

“ (c) For every hiring which is for a 
destination across the harbour via the 
Eastern Harbour Crossing where the 
hiring does not begin from a 
cross-harbour taxi stand         
$10”. ”. 

 
 


