OFFICE OF THE
HON KENNETH LEUNG
RUSINERHERBER

Room 918

Legislative Council Complex
1 Legislative Council Road
Central. Hong Kong
BEHEPEIERE 1S
IEEESAEII8E

Tel +852 2352 3209

Fax +852 3020 9849
Email info@kennethleung.hk
FB  Kennethleung.legco

000 CB)272/18-19(01) 1 [0 [
LC Paper No. CB(1)272/18-19(01)

5 December 2018
The Hon WONG Ting-kwong

Chairman .

Bills Committee

Financial Reporting Council (Amendment) Bill 2018
Legislative Council

Dear Chairman
Committee Stage Amendment

| intend to propose three alternative amendments to Clause 48 of the
Financial Reporting Council (Amendment) Bill 2018 (the “Bill”) to lower
the maximum pecuniary penalty level (currently at HK$10,000,000) for
misconduct by a registered PIE auditor or a registered responsible
person of a registered PIE auditor.

Please find the enclosed committee stage amendments (“CSA’s) for
discussion at the next committee meeting.

| will submit further papers to support the CSAs shortly.

Yours sincerely,

Kenneth Leung

Encls.

c.c. Ms Winnie Ng, Deputy Secretary for Financial Services and the
Treasury (Financial Services)

e e e e

KENNETHLEUNG.HK



Financial Reporting Council (Amendment) Bill 2018
Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by the Honourable Kenneth Leung

Clause Amendment Proposed

48 In the proposed section 37D, in subsection
3(b)(iv)(A), by deleting “$10,000,000” and
substituting “$1,000,000”.

48 In the proposed section 37E, in subsection
3(b)(iii)(A), by deleting “$10,000,000” and
substituting “$1,000,0007.



48

(2018 EHI TSR ERm (1BE]) MRBIEZR)

R A= Al RS

EEEIEE
ERENE 37D 155, 5 30)v)(A)E, fHE

“$10,000,000” 1L “$1,000,0007,

fEEERAYEE 37E &, 1£258 3(b)(ii)(A)E, filE

“$10,000,000” TffLLL“$1,000,000”.



Financial Reporting Council (Amendment) Bill 2018
Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by the Honourable Kenneth Leung

Clause Amendment Proposed

48 In the proposed section 37D, in subsection
3(b)(iv)(A), by deleting “$10,000,000” and
substituting “$5,000,0007.

48 In the proposed section 37E, in subsection
3(b)(1i1)(A), by deleting “$10,000,000” and
substituting “$5,000,000”.



A2~
v

48

48

(2018 EH B (BF]) HRHIEZE)

iy

%

=g e

\

FH 2R & n R BN AT B IE &

EEEIEE
EERRIVEE 37D R, 5 3(0)(Iv)(A)ER, =

“$10,000,000” TfLLL “85,000,0007.

EEEEMEE 37E &, 1E58 3(b)3i)NA)K, iz

“$10,000,000” T{tLL“$5,000,000” .



Financial Reporting Council (Amendment) Bill 2018
Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by the Honourable Kenneth Leung

Clause Amendment Proposed

48 In the proposed section 37D, in subsection
3(b)(1v)(A), by deleting “$10,000,000” and
substituting “$8,000,000.

48 In the proposed section 37E, in subsection
3(b)(ii1)(A), by deleting “$10,000,000” and
substituting “$8,000,000.



48

48

(2018 FEEAFERESRF (BE]) BBIEZR)

i

RRGERME

A

R4 B i B Bl B IEE

HEEREIEE
TEEERRAI S 37D &H, 7E5 3(0)(v)(A)EL, ==

“$10,000,000” TH{LLL “88,000,0007.

TEEREAIER 37E f&h, TE% 3(b)(i)(A)E, %

“$10,000,000” T{TLL“$8,000,000”.,





