
 
 

LC Paper No. CB(2)1497/18-19(01) 
 
 

National Anthem Bill 
 

Committee Stage 
 

Amendment to be moved by the Honourable CHAN Chi-chuen 

Clause  Amendment Proposed 

5 By deleting subclause (2). 

 

 
 

 



 
 

 
National Anthem Bill 

 
Committee Stage 

 
Amendment to be moved by the Honourable CHAN Chi-chuen 

 

Clause  Amendment Proposed 

6 By deleting subclause (1)(C) and subclause (5). 

 



 
 

 
National Anthem Bill 

 
Committee Stage 

 
Amendment to be moved by the Honourable CHAN Chi-chuen 

 

Clause  Amendment Proposed 

7 (a) By deleting subclause (2) and subclause (4). 

(b) In subclause (5), by deleting “or (4)”. 

 



 
 

 
National Anthem Bill 

 
Committee Stage 

 
Amendment to be moved by the Honourable CHAN Chi-chuen 

Clause  Amendment Proposed 

7 By deleting subclause (6) and substituting— 

“(6) A person who commits an offence under this section is liable on 

conviction to a fine at level 1 and to imprisonment for 1 month. 

 

 



 
 

 
National Anthem Bill 

 
Committee Stage 

 
Amendment to be moved by the Honourable CHAN Chi-chuen 

Clause  Amendment Proposed 

7(7) (a) In paragraph (a), by deleting “1 year” and substituting “30 days”. 

(b) In paragraph (b), by deleting “2 years” and substituting “60 days”. 

 

 

 


